
 
Show: Cinderella’s Glass Slipper 

Director: Joshua Gerstenlauer 

Date Created: 9/28/19 

Schedule Updates: 
 
6:00-8:00PM ALL Called Tuesday 10/1 
ALL CALLED to review Act One blocking 
from this week, together. 
 
6:00PM-8:30PM Called Thursday 10/3: 
Blocking Act Two and Music 
Talia M.            Chase D.        Evelyn K. 
Anaya G.          Emmalyn B.   James M. 
Audrina S.        Audra K.         Lily D. 
Adeline J.         Penelope A.   Taelyn T. 
 
 
1:00-4:30PM ALL CALLED Saturday 10/5 
Finish blocking Act Two, Music, Dance 
 

Notes: 
Start looking over movement, and stage 
notes (in the parenthesis/italicized sentences 
of student part in script) for Act Two. 
 
Reading, Singing, and dancing is going 
excellent so far! 
 
Keep up the strong character work! Everyone 
is making good acting choices too. 
 
Listen to the CD that was distributed 9/22 
 
Read through and practice 
blocking/movement/dance in Act I for 
Tuesday 10/1 
 
****See the director for your copy of CD 
 

Script and/or Blocking Updates: 
 
Act I was blocked up to the last song. 
 
Act II blocking on Thurs and Sat 10/3+5 
 
New Choreography for “Cinderella’s Waltz” 
was added Thursday 9/26 and looks very 
nice. Well done dancers! 
 
Thursday and Saturday, we will be learning 
new, and reviewing choreography for Act II 
 
 

Reminders: 
Notice the modified rehearsal time Thurs! 
 
Students are only to be attending when “ALL 

called” or their name is listed       

 
CALLING PARENT VOLUNTEERS! See any 
staff member, or production team member 
about volunteer opportunities!!!! 
 
Bring Scripts, water, snacks, and…..your 
handy-dandy Pencils!  
 
*Call board and Weekly Newsletter is posted 
every Sunday with updates and call-list! 
 

Other:   
*PLEASE, remind your student(s) that jumping off the stage of any kind, as well as running---

is prohibited. It is dangerous to do so, and a safe stage is a happy stage       

(Thank you)      

 


